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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-8024

  

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Safety Harness (Full Body)
TIME & (November 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 21, 2019
  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Group 1 FULL BODY HARNESS          
4 ea.   (Lawson #40967) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 386.03 376.94 431.31 440.40 445.00
Harness, Full Body Size: Small, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113106 PRICE 1,471.24 1,490.24 1,560.00 1,544.12 1,507.76 1,725.24 1,761.60 1,780.00

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106
10 ea.   (Lawson #40968) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 386.03 376.94 431.31 440.40 445.00
Harness, Full Body Size: Medium, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113109 PRICE 3,678.10 3,725.60 3,900.00 3,860.30 3,769.40 4,313.10 4,404.00 4,450.00

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109
15 ea.   (Lawson #40969) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 386.03 376.94 431.31 440.40 445.00
Harness, Full Body Size: Large MFG: DBI-SALA®,Part No. 1113112 PRICE 5,517.15 5,588.40 5,850.00 5,790.45 5,654.10 6,469.65 6,606.00 6,675.00

3. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112
12 ea.   (Lawson #40970) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 386.03 376.94 431.31 440.40 445.00
Harness, Full Body: Size: X-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113115 PRICE 4,413.72 4,470.72 4,680.00 4,632.36 4,523.28 5,175.72 5,284.80 5,340.00

4. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115
16 ea.     (Lawson #40971) UNIT 385.51 390.00 410.00 404.10 394.59 451.50 461.00 465.83
Harness, Full Body: Size: XX-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113118 PRICE 6,168.16 6,240.00 6,560.00 6,465.60 6,313.44 7,224.00 7,376.00 7,453.28

5. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 21,248.37 21,514.96 22,550.00 22,292.83 21,767.98 24,907.71 25,432.40 25,698.28
Group 2 CLIMBER

10 ea. (Lawson No. 31306) UNIT 375.86 380.23 400.00 393.98 384.90 440.19 449.50 480.88
Cable Climber and Carbiner LAD-SAF X2  DBI# 6160030 PRICE 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 3,939.80 3,849.00 4,401.90 4,495.00 4,808.80

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 3,939.80 3,849.00 4,401.90 4,495.00 4,808.80
Group 3 LANYARD

10 ea.   (Lawson #38236) UNIT 239.31 242.09 255.00 250.85 236.95 280.27 286.20 306.18
Lanyard, Shockwave2, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1244409 PRICE 2,393.10 2,420.90 2,550.00 2,508.50 2,369.50 2,802.70 2,862.00 3,061.80

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409
35 ea. (Lawson #40972) UNIT 348.27 352.33 370.00 365.06 356.47 407.88 416.50 420.83
Lanyard, Nano Lok SRL Enhanced, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 3101273 PRICE 12,189.45 12,331.55 12,950.00 12,777.10 12,476.45 14,275.80 14,577.50 14,729.05

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 3 TOTAL 14,582.55 14,752.45 15,500.00 15,285.60 14,845.95 17,078.50 17,439.50 17,790.85
Group 4 ROPE

15 ea.  (Lawson #38237) UNIT 110.34 111.63 110.34 115.67 112.94 129.23 132.00 141.18
Rope, Life Line, Sieze: 30 foot line, mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202753 PRICE 1,655.10 1,674.45 1,655.10 1,735.05 1,694.10 1,938.45 1,980.00 2,117.70

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753
15 ea.  (Lawson #38238) UNIT 126.20 127.67 126.20 132.29 129.18 147.81 150.95 161.47
Rope, Life Line, Size: 50 foot line, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202790 PRICE 1,893.00 1,915.05 1,893.00 1,984.35 1,937.70 2,217.15 2,264.25 2,422.05

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 4 TOTAL 3,548.10 3,589.50 3,548.10 3,719.40 3,631.80 4,155.60 4,244.25 4,539.75
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-8024

  

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Safety Harness (Full Body)
TIME & (November 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 21, 2019
  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
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Group 5 POSITIONING DEVICE
15 ea.  (Lawson #43052) 152.41 154.19 161.00 159.76 156.00 178.50 182.28 195.00
Positioning Device 21.6 Inches WEB Rebar Assbly, MFG: 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,396.40 2,340.00 2,677.50 2,734.20 2,925.00
DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1231520
MFG/Part No. DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 5 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,396.40 2,340.00 2,677.50 2,734.20 2,925.00
*  

TOTAL FOR GROUP 1-5 45,423.77 45,972.06 48,013.10 47,634.03 46,434.73 53,221.21 54,345.35 55,762.68
Option Year One - October 1, 2020 - September 30, 2021

Group 1 FULL BODY HARNESS          
4 ea.   (Lawson #40967) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 406.35 396.78 435.62 463.60 511.11
Harness, Full Body Size: Small, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113106 PRICE 1,471.24 1,490.24 1,560.00 1,625.40 1,587.12 1,742.48 1,854.40 2,044.44

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106
10 ea.   (Lawson #40968) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 406.35 396.78 435.62 463.60 511.11
Harness, Full Body Size: Medium, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113109 PRICE 3,678.10 3,725.60 3,900.00 4,063.50 3,967.80 4,356.20 4,636.00 5,111.10

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109
15 ea.   (Lawson #40969) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 406.35 396.78 435.62 463.60 511.11
Harness, Full Body Size: Large MFG: DBI-SALA®,Part No. 1113112 PRICE 5,517.15 5,588.40 5,850.00 6,095.25 5,951.70 6,534.30 6,954.00 7,666.65

3. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112
12 ea.   (Lawson #40970) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 406.35 396.78 435.62 463.60 511.11
Harness, Full Body: Size: X-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113115 PRICE 4,413.72 4,470.72 4,680.00 4,876.20 4,761.36 5,227.44 5,563.20 6,133.32

4. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115
16 ea.     (Lawson #40971) UNIT 385.51 390.00 410.00 425.37 415.36 456.02 485.31 535.71
Harness, Full Body: Size: XX-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113118 PRICE 6,168.16 6,240.00 6,560.00 6,805.92 6,645.76 7,296.32 7,764.96 8,571.36

5. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 21,248.37 21,514.96 22,550.00 23,466.27 22,913.74 25,156.74 26,772.56 29,526.87
Group 2 CLIMBER

10 ea. (Lawson No. 31306) UNIT 375.86 380.23 400.00 414.75 405.16 444.59 473.16 553.01
Cable Climber and Carbiner LAD-SAF X2  DBI# 6160030 PRICE 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 4,147.50 4,051.60 4,445.90 4,731.60 5,530.10

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 4,147.50 4,051.60 4,445.90 4,731.60 5,530.10
Group 3 LANYARD

10 ea.   (Lawson #38236) UNIT 239.31 242.09 255.00 264.06 249.42 283.07 301.25 352.10
Lanyard, Shockwave2, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1244409 PRICE 2,393.10 2,420.90 2,550.00 2,640.60 2,494.20 2,830.70 3,012.50 3,521.00

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409
35 ea. (Lawson #40972) UNIT 348.27 352.33 370.00 384.28 375.23 411.96 438.42 483.96
Lanyard, Nano Lok SRL Enhanced, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 3101273 PRICE 12,189.45 12,331.55 12,950.00 13,449.80 13,133.05 14,418.60 15,344.70 16,938.60

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 3 TOTAL 14,582.55 14,752.45 15,500.00 16,090.40 15,627.25 17,249.30 18,357.20 20,459.60
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Safety Harness (Full Body)
TIME & (November 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 21, 2019
  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
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Group 4 ROPE
15 ea.  (Lawson #38237) UNIT 110.34 111.63 110.34 121.76 118.88 130.52 138.92 162.35
Rope, Life Line, Sieze: 30 foot line, mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202753 PRICE 1,655.10 1,674.45 1,655.10 1,826.40 1,783.20 1,957.80 2,083.80 2,435.25

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753
15 ea.  (Lawson #38238) UNIT 126.20 127.67 126.20 139.26 135.98 149.29 158.87 185.69
Rope, Life Line, Size: 50 foot line, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202790 PRICE 1,893.00 1,915.05 1,893.00 2,088.90 2,039.70 2,239.35 2,383.05 2,785.35

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 4 TOTAL 3,548.10 3,589.50 3,548.10 3,915.30 3,822.90 4,197.15 4,466.85 5,220.60
Group 5 POSITIONING DEVICE

15 ea.  (Lawson #43052) 152.41 154.19 161.00 168.17 164.21 180.29 191.86 224.50
Positioning Device 21.6 Inches WEB Rebar Assbly, MFG: 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,522.55 2,463.15 2,704.35 2,877.90 3,367.50
DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1231520
MFG/Part No. DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 5 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,522.55 2,463.15 2,704.35 2,877.90 3,367.50
*  

TOTAL FOR GROUP 1-5 45,423.77 45,972.06 48,013.10 50,142.02 48,878.64 53,753.44 57,206.11 64,104.67
Option Year Two - October 1, 2021 - September 30, 2022

Group 1 FULL BODY HARNESS          
4 ea.   (Lawson #40967) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 427.74 418.82 439.98 488.04 562.22
Harness, Full Body Size: Small, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113106 PRICE 1,471.24 1,490.24 1,560.00 1,710.96 1,675.28 1,759.92 1,952.16 2,248.88

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106
10 ea.   (Lawson #40968) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 427.74 418.82 439.98 488.04 562.22
Harness, Full Body Size: Medium, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113109 PRICE 3,678.10 3,725.60 3,900.00 4,277.40 4,188.20 4,399.80 4,880.40 5,622.20

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109
15 ea.   (Lawson #40969) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 427.74 418.82 439.98 488.04 562.22
Harness, Full Body Size: Large MFG: DBI-SALA®,Part No. 1113112 PRICE 5,517.15 5,588.40 5,850.00 6,416.10 6,282.30 6,599.70 7,320.60 8,433.30

3. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112
12 ea.   (Lawson #40970) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 427.74 418.82 439.98 488.04 562.22
Harness, Full Body: Size: X-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113115 PRICE 4,413.72 4,470.72 4,680.00 5,132.88 5,025.84 5,279.76 5,856.48 6,746.64

4. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115
16 ea.     (Lawson #40971) UNIT 385.51 390.00 410.00 447.76 438.43 460.58 510.86 589.31
Harness, Full Body: Size: XX-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113118 PRICE 6,168.16 6,240.00 6,560.00 7,164.16 7,014.88 7,369.28 8,173.76 9,428.96

5. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 21,248.37 21,514.96 22,550.00 24,701.50 24,186.50 25,408.46 28,183.40 32,479.98
Group 2 CLIMBER

10 ea. (Lawson No. 31306) UNIT 375.86 380.23 400.00 436.58 427.67 449.04 498.06 608.32
Cable Climber and Carbiner LAD-SAF X2  DBI# 6160030 PRICE 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 4,365.80 4,276.70 4,490.40 4,980.60 6,083.20

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 160030 DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 4,365.80 4,276.70 4,490.40 4,980.60 6,083.20
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Safety Harness (Full Body)
TIME & (November 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 21, 2019
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Group 3 LANYARD
10 ea.   (Lawson #38236) UNIT 239.31 242.09 255.00 277.96 263.28 285.90 317.12 387.32
Lanyard, Shockwave2, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1244409 PRICE 2,393.10 2,420.90 2,550.00 2,779.60 2,632.80 2,859.00 3,171.20 3,873.20

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409
35 ea. (Lawson #40972) UNIT 348.27 352.33 370.00 404.51 396.08 416.08 461.50 532.36
Lanyard, Nano Lok SRL Enhanced, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 3101273 PRICE 12,189.45 12,331.55 12,950.00 14,157.85 13,862.80 14,562.80 16,152.50 18,632.60

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 3 TOTAL 14,582.55 14,752.45 15,500.00 16,937.45 16,495.60 17,421.80 19,323.70 22,505.80
Group 4 ROPE

15 ea.  (Lawson #38237) UNIT 110.34 111.63 110.34 128.17 125.49 131.83 146.23 178.59
Rope, Life Line, Sieze: 30 foot line, mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202753 PRICE 1,655.10 1,674.45 1,655.10 1,922.55 1,882.35 1,977.45 2,193.45 2,678.85

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753
15 ea.  (Lawson #38238) UNIT 126.20 127.67 126.20 146.59 143.53 150.78 167.25 204.26
Rope, Life Line, Size: 50 foot line, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202790 PRICE 1,893.00 1,915.05 1,893.00 2,198.85 2,152.95 2,261.70 2,508.75 3,063.90

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 4 TOTAL 3,548.10 3,589.50 3,548.10 4,121.40 4,035.30 4,239.15 4,702.20 5,742.75
Group 5 POSITIONING DEVICE

15 ea.  (Lawson #43052) 152.41 154.19 161.00 177.03 173.33 182.09 201.97 246.68
Positioning Device 21.6 Inches WEB Rebar Assbly, MFG: 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,655.45 2,599.95 2,731.35 3,029.55 3,700.20
DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1231520
MFG/Part No. DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 5 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,655.45 2,599.95 2,731.35 3,029.55 3,700.20
*  

TOTAL FOR GROUP 1-5 45,423.77 45,972.06 48,013.10 52,781.60 51,594.05 54,291.16 60,219.45 70,511.93
Option Year Three - October 1, 2022 - September 30, 2023

Group 1 FULL BODY HARNESS          
4 ea.   (Lawson #40967) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 450.26 465.36 444.38 513.73 NO BID
Harness, Full Body Size: Small, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113106 PRICE 1,471.24 1,490.24 1,560.00 1,801.04 1,861.44 1,777.52 2,054.92  

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106 DBI SALA 1113106  
10 ea.   (Lawson #40968) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 450.26 465.36 444.38 513.73  
Harness, Full Body Size: Medium, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113109 PRICE 3,678.10 3,725.60 3,900.00 4,502.60 4,653.60 4,443.80 5,137.30 NO BID

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109 DBI-SALA 1113109  
15 ea.   (Lawson #40969) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 450.26 465.36 444.38 513.73  
Harness, Full Body Size: Large MFG: DBI-SALA®,Part No. 1113112 PRICE 5,517.15 5,588.40 5,850.00 6,753.90 6,980.40 6,665.70 7,705.95 NO BID

3. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112 DBI-SALA 1113112  
12 ea.   (Lawson #40970) UNIT 367.81 372.56 390.00 450.26 465.36 444.38 513.73  
Harness, Full Body: Size: X-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113115 PRICE 4,413.72 4,470.72 4,680.00 5,403.12 5,584.32 5,332.56 6,164.76 NO BID

4. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115 DBI-SALA 1113115  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Safety Harness (Full Body)
TIME & (November 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 21, 2019
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16 ea.     (Lawson #40971) UNIT 385.51 390.00 410.00 471.76 487.14 465.19 537.76  
Harness, Full Body: Size: XX-Large, MFG: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1113118 PRICE 6,168.16 6,240.00 6,560.00 7,548.16 7,794.24 7,443.04 8,604.16 NO BID

5. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118 DBI-SALA 1113118  
 

NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 21,248.37 21,514.96 22,550.00 26,008.82 26,874.00 25,662.62 29,667.09  

Group 2 CLIMBER
10 ea. (Lawson No. 31306) UNIT 375.86 380.23 400.00 459.56 475.19 453.53 524.29  
Cable Climber and Carbiner LAD-SAF X2  DBI# 6160030 PRICE 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 4,595.60 4,751.90 4,535.30 5,242.90 NO BID

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 160030 DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA D626160030 DBI/SALA 6160030 DBI/SALA 6160030  

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 3,758.60 3,802.30 4,000.00 4,595.60 4,751.90 4,535.30 5,242.90 NO BID
Group 3 LANYARD

10 ea.   (Lawson #38236) UNIT 239.31 242.09 255.00 292.59 292.53 288.76 333.82  
Lanyard, Shockwave2, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1244409 PRICE 2,393.10 2,420.90 2,550.00 2,925.90 2,925.30 2,887.60 3,338.20 NO BID

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409 DBI-SALA 1244409  
35 ea. (Lawson #40972) UNIT 348.27 352.33 370.00 425.80 440.09 420.24 485.80  
Lanyard, Nano Lok SRL Enhanced, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 3101273 PRICE 12,189.45 12,331.55 12,950.00 14,903.00 15,403.15 14,708.40 17,003.00 NO BID

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273 DBI-SALA 3101273  

NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 3 TOTAL 14,582.55 14,752.45 15,500.00 17,828.90 18,328.45 17,596.00 20,341.20  

Group 4 ROPE
15 ea.  (Lawson #38237) UNIT 110.34 111.63 110.34 134.92 139.43 133.15 153.93  
Rope, Life Line, Sieze: 30 foot line, mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202753 PRICE 1,655.10 1,674.45 1,655.10 2,023.80 2,091.45 1,997.25 2,308.95 NO BID

1. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753 DBI SALA 1202753  
15 ea.  (Lawson #38238) UNIT 126.20 127.67 126.20 154.31 159.48 152.29 176.06  
Rope, Life Line, Size: 50 foot line, Mfg: DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1202790 PRICE 1,893.00 1,915.05 1,893.00 2,314.65 2,392.20 2,284.35 2,640.90 NO BID

2. MFG/Part No. TOTAL DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790 DBI SALA 1202790  

NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 4 TOTAL 3,548.10 3,589.50 3,548.10 4,338.45 4,483.65 4,281.60 4,949.85  

Group 5 POSITIONING DEVICE
15 ea.  (Lawson #43052) 152.41 154.19 161.00 186.35 192.59 183.91 212.61  
Positioning Device 21.6 Inches WEB Rebar Assbly, MFG: 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,795.25 2,888.85 2,758.65 3,189.15 NO BID
DBI-SALA®, Part No. 1231520  
MFG/Part No. DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520 DBI SALA 1231520  

NO BID
SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 5 2,286.15 2,312.85 2,415.00 2,795.25 2,888.85 2,758.65 3,189.15  

*  
NO BID

TOTAL FOR GROUP 1-5 45,423.77 45,972.06 48,013.10 55,567.02 57,326.85 54,834.17 63,390.19  

Net Net Net 2% Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 
Delivery Days 7-10 days 10 days 10 days  10 days 7-10 days 10 days 21 days

*LOW BIDDER
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FOR: Safety Harness (Full Body)
TIME & (November 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
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BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Abatix Corp. Grainger Demandstar
Airgas Gravitec Systems SAWS Website
Alamo Iron Works Kennedy Wive Rope
Border Construction Midwest Unlimited
Bullchase MSC Indust Supply
Cintas Northern Safety 
Conney Safety Supply
Construct Assurance Saf-T-Glove
Durawear Sid Tool Co.
GME Supply Sunbelt

Texas Safety Supply
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